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Brief Background of ITVF’s Co-investment Partners 
(Information provided by Co-investment Partners) 

 
 
Beyond Ventures (海闊天空創投) 

Established in 2017, Beyond Ventures focuses on investing in technology, media and 
telecommunications, artificial intelligence, biotechnology and healthcare sectors.  The fund 
management team is led by three Co-Founders & Managing Partners, Mr. Lap Man, Mr. Alex 
Fang and Mr. Marvin Hung as well as an investment company - Hony Capital.   
 
BVCF (百奧財富) 

Established in 2005, BVCF focuses on investing in international growth stage life sciences 
companies.  Investment subsectors include biopharmaceuticals, medical technology, healthcare 
IT and healthcare services.  The fund management team is led by Dr. Yang Zhi, Founder & 
Managing Partner, and two other General Partners, Dr. Robert Li and Ms. Vanessa Huang.   
 
Greater Bay Area Homeland Development Fund (大灣區共同家園發展基金) 

Established in 2018, the Greater Bay Area Homeland Development Fund focuses on investing in 
consumer, healthcare and innovative technology sectors in the Greater Bay Area.  The fund 
management team is led by veterans in the industry.   
 
Hendale Fund (漢德基金) 

Established in 1995, Hendale focuses on sectors with robust growth characteristics supported 
by long term trends and its investments are open to all sectors. The fund management team is 
led by Mr. Henry Lee, Managing Partner, and Mr. Geoff Lee, Partner.  
 
Isola Capital  (道源資本) 

Established in 2014, Isola Capital focuses on investing in consumer and related sectors with 
companies that possess intellectual property, such as fintech, online-to-offline commerce, and 
development of technologies relevant to education, financial services, insurance, health and 
wellness, as well as food and beverage sectors. The fund management team is led by Mr. 
Anthony Chan, Chief Executive Officer, Shareholder and Member of the Board of Isola Capital 
Group and Mr. David Zhang, Managing Director.  
 
Lingfeng Capital (領渢資本) 

Established in 2015, Lingfeng Capital focuses on investing in fintech.  The fund management 
team is led by Mr. Ning Ma, Founder and Partner and Mr. Ming Shu, Partner.   
 
  



 

2 

 

 
 
MindWorks Ventures (概念資本) 

Established in 2014, MindWorks Ventures seeks to invest in growth-stage technology 
companies with a focus in logistics, travel, artificial intelligence and fintech.  The fund 
management team is led by two Founding Partners, Mr. David Chang and Mr. Joe Chan. 
 
Radiant Tech Ventures (慧科科創投資) 

Established in 2016,  Radiant Tech Ventures  focuses on investing in internet economy, fintech, 
robotics, healthcare technology, smart city, autonomous driving, artificial intelligence and new 
materials sectors.  The fund management team is lead by Dr. Gordon Yen, Founding & 
Managing Partner, and  Mr. Chow Ching Ning, Michael,  Managing Partner.  
 
Hong Kong X Technology Fund (香港 X 科技基金) 

Established in 2016, Hong Kong X Technology Fund focuses on investing in big data, artificial 
intelligence, robotics, biotechnology, medical science, medicine, microelectronics, materials, 
energy and fintech sectors.  The fund management team is led by three Founders & Partners, 
Mr. Shen Nan Peng, Prof. Li Ze Xiang and Prof. Chen Guan Hua. 
 


